Amendment No. 1 10 MOU No. 201 8-0352.PW

ITEM #18-0755

AMENDMENT NO. 1 ITEE\V 7’16 IQ' Q)2 g
TO MEMORANDUM OF
UNDERSTANDING BETWEEN SANTA FE
COUNTY AND THE CITY OF
SANTA FE FOR PARKING IN THE CITY OF
SANTA FE

AMENDMENT No. 1 to the Memorandum of Understanding, dated June
11, 2018 (the “MOU™), between the City of Santa Fe (the “City) and Santa
Fe County (the “County™).

RECITALS

According to the MOU, the County purchased 25 parking permits from the City which
permit the County the use of 25 parking spaces at the Santa Fe Community Convention
Center municipal parking garage ("SFCCC”) and the Railyard municipal parking
garage. By this Amendment No. 1 the City and County agree to amend the MOU to
provide for an increase to the number of parking permits at the SFCCC and the Railyard
municipal parking garage from 25 to 30 (an increase of five parking spaces).

1. Section 3.A.1. of the MOU is amended by deleting the number “25” and repiace
with “30”; delete “$1,625.00" and replace it with “$1,950.00% and delete “$19,500.00”
and replace with “$23,400.00.”

2. Section 3.B.1 of the MOU is amended by deleting the number “25” and replace with
1‘30.19

3. Section 3.C.1. of the MOU is amended by deleting the number “25” and replace
with “30.”

4. Section 4.A. of the MOU is amended by deleting the number “$4,745.00” and
replace with “$5,070.00."”

3. The increase in parking fees to be paid by the County and the increase in the number
of parking spaces available to the County as provided in this Amendment No. 1 will be
effective commencing January 1, 2019.

6. All other provisions of the MOU not specifically amended or modified by this
Amendment No. 1 shall remain in full force and effect.

7. This Amendment No. | is effective upon the date of last signature by the City and
the County.




WL

Amendment No. T 1o MQU No. 201 8-0352-PW

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have set their hands.

CITY OF SANTA FE:

Alfn Webber, Mayor

3/sli

Date:

Approved as to form:

W/ 5/ D5

City Attorney

Approved:
Finance D"ﬁtor ?
ATTEST:

%—nmc{,;al-qx\o

olanda Y. Vigll, Cit§fGlerk *
ce iy, |21 (2019

COUNTY OF SANTA FE:

KatHerine Miller
Santa Fe County Manager

Date: /2 (L [ F

A ed as to form:
i /W&
R. Bruce Frederick”
Santa Fe County Attorney
Fina partment:
l 7.’/0] i

Stephranit S. Clarke

Finance Director



